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Direct Line: 01744 457237 
 
Email: sthelensccg.foi@nhs.net 
 
Our Ref: FOI 8193 
 
Date: 11th December 2020 
 

 
 

Dear Sir/ Madam 
 
Re: Freedom of Information Request 
 
Further to your recent Freedom of Information request regarding Fertility Treatment, please 
see below our response to your request. 
 
Request: 
 
For the purpose of my current research into the role of the child welfare principle in fertility 
regulation and practice, I would be most grateful if you could provide any information you 
hold in respect of the following: 
 
BACKGROUND INFORMATION 
As a prerequisite to fertility treatment, s13(5) of the Human Fertilisation and Embryology Act 
1990 (the Act) (as amended by the Human Fertilisation and Embryology Act 2008) requires 
that a mandatory welfare of the child assessment is carried out before any treatment can be 
provided. However, the licence provisions (including the mandatory child welfare 
assessment) apply only to treatment services regulated by the Act i.e. activities involving 
gametes and/or embryos (Paragraph 1(1)(a)-(g) Schedule 2 Human Fertilisation and 
Embryology Act 1990). 
 
The 8th and 9th Codes of Practice of the Human Fertilisation and Embryology Authority state 
that:  Centres providing treatments that are not regulated by the HFEA but that fall within the 
definition of ‘treatment services’…may also find this guidance note [on the welfare of the 
child] helpful. 
 
The law broadly defines ‘treatment services’ as ‘medical, surgical or obstetric services 
provided to the public or a section of the public for the purpose of assisting women to carry 
children’ (Section 2(1) Human Fertilisation and Embryology Act 1990). Such treatments 
might include, for example, gynaecological surgery for fertility purposes or the provision of 
fertility drugs to boost ovulation.  For the avoidance of doubt, the above may be summarised 
as follows: 
 

A. Treatments requiring a licence under 

the HFE Act 1990 to which the 

mandatory licence conditions (such as 

the welfare of the child assessment) 

apply: 

B. Treatments that do not require a licence 

under the HFE Act and to which the 

mandatory licence conditions (such as the 

welfare of the child assessment) do not 

apply: 

Activities involving the creation, procuring, 

keeping, testing, processing and 

distribution of embryos and gametes. This 

includes: 

• IVF 

Medical, surgical or obstetric treatment 

services for the purpose of assisting women to 

carry children that do not involve gametes 

and/or embryos including, but not limited to: 

• Surgery to unblock the fallopian tubes 
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• ICSI 

• IUI/AI 

• PGD 

• Oocyte donation 

• Sperm donation 

• Surgery to remove pelvic adhesions (e.g. 

hysteroscopic adhesiolysis) 

• Surgery to remove endometriosis tissue 

• Myomectomy (removal of fibroid(s)) 

• Provision of fertility drugs to boost ovulation 

• Provision of ovulation testing kits 

 
In light of this, please can you confirm: 
 
i. TREATMENT FOR FERTILITY PURPOSES NOT REGULATED BY THE HFE ACTS 

(COLUMN B) 
 
1. Whether your clinic or third-party provider has ever followed the guidance in Section 8 

of the HFEA Code of Practice and conducted a welfare of the child assessment prior to 
providing treatment that is not regulated by the Human Fertilisation and Embryology 
Act 1990 but that falls within the definition of ‘treatment services’ for the purpose of the 
Act (i.e. treatments falling into in column B above)? 

 
2. If your centre or third-party provider has conducted welfare assessments in such cases 

in the past five years, please can you confirm: 
a) How many assessments were carried out? 
b) What treatment(s) the welfare assessment was conducted in respect of? 
c) How did the clinic or third-party provider determine what particular treatment(s) the 

welfare assessment should apply to? Please outline any guiding 
principles/protocols considered. 

d) Whether any, and if so, how many prospective patient(s) were refused treatment (of 
the kind in Column B) on welfare of the child grounds? 

e) For what reason(s) (in general terms) were these individuals refused treatment on 
welfare of the child grounds? 

 
ii. FERTILITY TREATMENT REGULATED BY THE HFE ACTS (COLUMN A) 
 
3. In respect of treatment services regulated by the HFE Acts (i.e. treatments falling into 

column A including IVF/AI etc.), in the past five years, please can you confirm how 
many individuals/couples have been refused treatment on the basis of a welfare 
assessment? 
 

4. For what reason(s) (in general terms) were these individuals/couples refused 
treatment on welfare of the child grounds? 
 

5. In the event that a welfare of the child assessment raises concerns and it is not 
immediately clear that the patient(s) should be refused treatment, what procedure 
does your centre follow to discuss more difficult cases? For example, is the 
involvement of an ethics committee sought to assist with decision-making? 
 

6. Please confirm whether your centre/third-party provider considers the following factors 
to be relevant to the welfare of the child assessment (as opposed to, or in addition to, 
being medically relevant), and if so, please briefly explain how the centre/third-party 
provider considers this to be relevant: 
a) The stability or length of the relationship of the couple seeking treatment? 
b) The living arrangements of the prospective patient(s)? 
c) The financial interdependence of the couple seeking treatment? 
d) The smoking status of the prospective patient(s)? 

https://portal.hfea.gov.uk/media/1527/2019-12-16-code-of-practice-9th-edition-december-2019.pdf
https://portal.hfea.gov.uk/media/1527/2019-12-16-code-of-practice-9th-edition-december-2019.pdf
https://portal.hfea.gov.uk/media/1527/2019-12-16-code-of-practice-9th-edition-december-2019.pdf


 

Working in partnership with and in collaboration with  

e) The prospective patient(s) consumption of alcohol (that is not alcohol abuse)? 
f) If funding is provided for single women, the single status of the woman seeking 

treatment? 
 
7. If you do not hold details in respect of all questions above on behalf of your third-party 

provider, please can you provide the name and contact email of the third-party 
provider so that they may be contacted in the alternative? 

 
Response: 
 
There is no "welfare of the child" check within St Helen’s Subfertility Policy and accordingly, 
our individual funding request team (IFR Team) are applying policy and considering 
exceptionality (only) we do not undertake welfare of the child checks in the policy area of 
commissioning. 
 

• However, there are some relevant factors within the Subfertility Policy as follows: 

• section 8 - requires the female to achieve a BMI between 19 - 29.9 before subfertility 
treatment begins;  

• section 9 - “patients” must be confirmed non-smokers and must continue to be non-
smoking throughout treatment,   

• section 10 - “patients” alcohol intake must be within the Department of Health 
guidelines and they must not use recreational drugs.  

• Evidence of smoking, drug taking or drinking in excess of the guidelines results in 
treatment cessation.   

 
Where the IFR Team are asked to consider whether a patient meets the policy criteria for 
IVF Treatment, clinicians and administrators compare the policy criteria (including these 
factors), against the information provided within the application form.  However, the case is 
then recorded as an approval or a decline - and the IFR Team do not record data in such a 
way that would enable us to interrogate the data to identify the cases where IVF has been 
declined on the basis of BMI / smoking / drug taking or excess drinking - so we would not be 
able to provide any supporting data in respect of this FOI. 
 
Section 8 of the Code of Practice - Welfare of the Child reveals that the guidance sets out 
the factors to be considered during the CLINICAL assessment process e.g. previous 
convictions relating to harming children, violence / serious misconduct, mental / physical 
conditions etc.  
 
Our providers will have a document template that they complete with each couple to ensure 
they have assessed them against each criterion before they progress to treatment including 
safeguarding and overall risk assessment.   
 
The below providers should be contacted for the relevant assessment documentation and 
information you seek.   

• CARE Fertility Manchester - at least one approval note 

• Liverpool Women’s Hospital (The Hewitt Centre) - at least one approval noted 

• Manchester Fertility Centre 

• St Helens & Knowsley Teaching Hospital 

• Wrightington, Wigan & Leigh Hospital 
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Should you require any further information or clarification regarding this response or do not 
feel that your request has been answered as you would expect, please contact us to 
discuss.  
 
We also wish to take this opportunity to inform you that a formal complaints and internal 
review process is available, which will be managed by a FOI Appeals Officer. 
 
This can be formally requested and must be done within a reasonable period of time (3 
calendar months) from the date this response was issued.  
 
Where you are not satisfied with the response to a request for information that falls within the 
Environmental Information Regulations, you should make a representation for a review to 
FOI Appeals Officer, sthelensccg.foi@nhs.net within 40 days of receipt of the response. 
 
If you are not satisfied with our review under the Freedom of Information Act or the 
Environmental Information Regulations, you may apply directly to the Information 
Commissioners Office (ICO) for a review of your appeal decision.  Generally, the ICO cannot 
make a decision unless you have exhausted our complaints procedure.  
 
The ICO can be contacted at;  
 
ICO, Wycliffe House, Water Lane, Wilmslow, Cheshire, SK9 5AF  
www.ico.gov.uk   
 
Should you need any further clarification or assistance, please do not hesitate to contact me 
quoting the above reference. 
 
Yours sincerely,  
 

 
 
Angela Delea 
Associate Director – Corporate Governance 
NHS St Helens Clinical Commissioning Group    
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